
 
Assistant or Associate Professor – Health Education and Promotion 

Department of Kinesiology and Health Studies 
Southeastern Louisiana University 

 
The Department of Kinesiology and Health Studies at Southeastern Louisiana University 
invites applicants for a tenure-track Assistant or Associate Professor of Health Education 
and Promotion position to begin August 2009. Responsibilities will include teaching 
undergraduate and graduate courses in health (e.g., personal and community health, 
drug education, human sexuality, women's health, stress management). Additional 
responsibilities include academic advising, engaging in research and scholarly activities, 
and university service. The successful candidate must have a doctorate degree 
specializing in Health Education/Promotion or closely related field. ABD candidates may 
apply, however, to be eligible for the position, applicants must have completed all 
requirements for the doctorate degree by June 1, 2009.  Desired qualifications include 
university teaching experience, evidence of scholarly productivity and potential to 
establish and maintain lines of research, and CHES certification.  
 
To apply for this position, please complete and submit an on line application, which will 
include the names and contact information for three references and the following 
attachments: letter of application, vitae, recent publications, and transcripts (official 
transcripts required upon employment). Use this link to the university human resources 
page to apply for this position: http://www.selu.edu/admin/hr/vacancies/index.html. 
 
Southeastern Louisiana University is a progressive regional comprehensive university 
enrolling over 15,000 undergraduate and graduate students.  The University’s home, 
Hammond, is at the crossroads of Interstates 55 and 12 in the heart of Louisiana’s 
thriving Northshore, the fastest growing region of the state. The Department of 
Kinesiology and Health Studies is one of three academic units in the College of Nursing 
and Health Sciences. The department serves 700 undergraduate majors pursuing degree 
programs in Athletic Training, Health and Physical Education Teacher Education, Health 
Education and Promotion, Kinesiology, and Sport Management, and 50 graduate 
students seeking the master’s degree in Health and Kinesiology. Applicants are 
encouraged to learn more about the department and university by visiting our website 
at http://www.selu.edu/khs. Southeastern is an AA/ADA/EEO employer. 
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